MINUTES
WAYNE COUNTY AIRPORT AUTHORITY
BOARD MEETING
May 27, 2010

Roll Call

Meeting of the Wayne County Airport Authority Board called to order at 1:30 p.m.
at the Marriott Detroit Metro Airport, 30559 Flynn Drive, Romulus:

Charlie Williams — Chairperson
Reneé Axt — Vice Chairperson
Mary Zuckerman — Secretary
James Nicholson

Samuel Nouhan

Bernard Parker

James Settles, Jr.

Also Present: See attached sign-in sheet.

Approval of Minutes from March 25, 2010 Board Meeting

The Wayne County Airport Authority Board meeting minutes from
March 25, 2010 were approved.

Motion by James Nicholson; Supported by James Settles
Motion unanimously approved.

Consent Agenda — Contracts and Contract Amendments

Contracts and Contract Amendments were approved.

Motion by Bernard Parker; Supported by James Nicholson
Motion unanimously approved.

Barnard Dunkelberg & Company, Inc. (Federal Aviation Regulations
(FAR) Part 150 Noise Study - Detroit Metropolitan Airport)

Resolution to approve a contract with Barnard Dunkelberg & Company,
Inc., to provide consulting services to assist with the implementation of
Federal Aviation Regulations (FAR) Part 150 Noise Study
recommendations for Detroit Metropolitan Airport. The term of the
contract is a maximum of four (4) years commencing upon issuance of
Notice of Award; initial three (3) year term, with a one (1) year renewal
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option exercisable by the CEO, subject to the vendor's satisfactory
performance and availability of budgeted funds. The cost of the contract
is not to exceed $285,000.00. The contract was competitively solicited;
contract was deemed only qualified response from a responsive
respondent.

[Approved Resolution No. 10 - 30]

William A. Pritula and Sons, L.L.C. (Fire Hydrant Testing, Inspection,
Repair/Replacement Services)

Resolution to approve a contract with William A. Pritula and Sons,
L.L.C., to provide fire hydrant inspection, repair/replacement and
maintenance services, on an as-needed basis at Detroit Metropolitan and
Willow Run Airports. The cost of the contract is not to exceed
$390,000.00. The term of the contract is three (3) years and will
commence upon Notice of Award. The contract was competitively
solicited; contract deemed lowest responsive bid from a responsible
bidder.

[Approved Resolution No. 10 - 31]
Applied Pavement Technology, Inc. (Airfield Pavement Assessment)

Resolution to approve a contract with Applied Pavement Technology,
Inc., to provide consulting services to update the airfield pavement
assessment at Detroit Metropolitan Airport and to perform a pavement
assessment at Willow Run Airport. The term of the contract will
commence upon Notice of Award and terminate upon the Airport
Authority's final payment for all required services (Estimated completion:
October 2010). The cost of the contract is not to exceed $185,000.00.
The contract was competitively solicited; contract deemed most
responsive proposal from a responsible proposer.

[Approved Resolution No. 10 - 32]

J.D. Candler Roofing, Inc. (Preventative Maintenance and Repair
Services of Building Roofs — Detroit Metropolitan Airport)

Resolution to approve a contract with J.D. Candler Roofing, Inc., to
provide preventative maintenance and repair services on forty-two (42)
designated building roofs located throughout Detroit Metropolitan Airport.
The cost of the contract is not to exceed $300,000.00. The term of the
contract is a maximum of three (3) years commencing upon issuance of
Notice of Award; initial one (1) year term, with two (2) one-year renewal
options exercisable by the CEO, subject to the vendor's satisfactory

WCAA Board Meeting
Minutes — 5/27/10
Page 2



performance and availability of budgeted funds. The contract was
competitively solicited; contract deemed most responsive proposal from a
responsible proposer.

[Approved Resolution No. 10 - 33]

Envision Electric Contracting, LLC (Preventative Maintenance and
Repair Services to Parking Decks — Detroit Metropolitan Airport)

Resolution to approve an amendment to add funding to the existing
contract with Envision Electric Contracting, LLC, for preventative
maintenance and unscheduled repair and maintenance services for the
Blue Deck and McNamara Terminal Parking Deck at Detroit Metropolitan
Airport. The cost of the amendment is not to exceed $296,505.00; for total
contract costs not to exceed $4,699,180.00. The amendment will be
effective upon Board approval.

[Approved Resolution No. 10 - 34]
Lakeshore Energy Services, LLC (Natural Gas Brokerage Services)

Resolution to approve a contract with Lakeshore Energy Services, LLC,
to provide brokerage services for the purchase of natural gas for the
Airport Authority. The term of the contract is a maximum of five (5) years
commencing upon Notice of Award; initial three (3) year term, with one (1)
two-year renewal option, which will require Board approval. The cost of
the contract is not to exceed $10,428,088.00. The contract was
competitively solicited; contract deemed most responsive proposal from a
responsible proposer.

[Approved Resolution No. 10 - 35]

Stansley Mineral Resources (Dried Non-Heated Sand for Detroit
Metropolitan and Willow Run Airports)

Resolution to approve a contract with Stansley Mineral Resources to
purchase dried non-heated sand on an as-needed basis through a
cooperative purchasing agreement with the State of Michigan for snow
and ice control at Detroit Metropolitan and Willow Run Airports. The cost
of the contract is not to exceed $1,448,000.00. The term of the contract is
April 13, 2009 through April 12, 2011, with three (3) one-year renewal
options subject to the State of Michigan's extension of the contract,
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10.

1.

vendor's satisfactory performance and availability of budgeted funds. The
Airport Authority plans to start using the contract for the 2010-2011 snow
season.

[Approved Resolution No. 10 - 36]

Octagon Process, L.L.C. (Liquid Runway Deicer - Detroit
Metropolitan Airport)

Resolution to approve a contract with Octagon Process, L.L.C., to
provide for the purchase and delivery of liquid runway deicer on an as-
needed basis for Detroit Metropolitan Airport. The term of the contract is
one (1) year from Notice of Award. The cost of the contract is not to
exceed $2,029,480.00. The contract was competitively solicited; contract
deemed lowest responsive bid from a responsible bidder.

[Approved Resolution No. 10 - 37]

M-B Companies, Inc. (Runway Broom Vehicles — Detroit Metropolitan
Airport)

Resolution to approve a one-time procurement from M-B Companies,
Inc., of two (2) replacement high performance, runway broom, air-blast
system vehicles for use at Detroit Metropolitan Airport. The cost of the
procurement will be $463,392.00. The contract was competitively
solicited; contract deemed lowest responsive bid from a responsible
bidder.

[Approved Resolution No. 10 - 38]

Owosso Motors, Inc., D/B/A Signature Ford Lincoln Mercury
(Replacement Vehicles)

Resolution to approve the use of a cooperative purchase agreement with
Macomb County to purchase six (6) replacement vehicles for the Airport
Authority from Owosso Motors, Inc., D/B/A Signature Ford Lincoln
Mercury. The cost of the one-time procurement will be $144,528.00.

[Approved Resolution No. 10 - 39]

Continental Distributors, Inc., D/B/A Continental Services (Snack and
Beverage Vending Service Concession - Detroit Metropolitan
Airport)

Resolution to approve an amendment to the existing contract with
Continental Distributors, Inc., D/B/A Continental Services, to modify
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V.

12.

13.

14.

Exhibit C of the snack and beverage vending service contract to allow for
the relocation, addition or deletion of vending machines, at Detroit
Metropolitan Airport. The proposed amendment will be effective upon
Board approval. All other terms and conditions in the contract remain
unchanged.

[Approved Resolution No. 10 - 40]

American Airlines, Inc. (Lease of Space - Detroit Metropolitan
Airport)

Resolution to approve a lease agreement with American Airlines, Inc.,
for a portion of Air Freight Building No. 610 and related facilities and
premises at Detroit Metropolitan Airport. The anticipated annual revenue
for the first year of the lease agreement is $91,785.92. The lease
agreement will commence June 1, 2010 and terminate May 31, 2015.

[Approved Resolution No. 10 - 41]

Delta Air Lines, Inc. (Airport Use and Lease Agreement — Detroit
Metropolitan Airport)

This item is removed from agenda.

AvFlight Willow Run Corporation (Lease and Fixed Base Operator
(FBO) Agreement — Willow Run Airport)

Resolution to approve an amendment to extend the Lease and Fixed Base
Operator (FBO) Agreement with AvFlight Willow Run Corporation to
allow the company additional time to assess its future operations at Willow
Run Airport. The proposed amended lease term will commence July 1,
2010 and terminate December 31, 2010, with an option to further extend
on a month-to-month basis for up to an additional six (6) months.

[Approved Resolution No. 10 - 42]

Chief Executive Officer (CEO) Contract

Bernard Parker motioned to extend the employment contract of Lester Robinson,
the Chief Executive Officer, for one (1) additional month to June 30, 2010. Motion

supported by Reneé Axt.

James Nicholson commented that it has been an honor to work with Lester
Robinson as Chief Executive Officer, and he has found Lester to be a highly
effective and knowledgeable leader and a man of integrity and vision.  Mr.
Nicholson highlighted Lester Robinson's accomplishments during his tenure,
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including the opening of two new terminals, a sixth jet runway and addition of
significant international routes. Mr. Nicholson further remarked that Lester
Robinson has successfully navigated the ups and downs of a volatile economy
and the bankruptcy of its major carrier and has built an outstanding team,
focused on safety, customer service and efficiency; all while keeping costs as low
as possible for the airlines.

Mr. Nicholson further expressed his concern that, given Mr. Robinson’'s
outstanding performance, one would expect the Board to reward him with a raise
and a contract renewal but that the Board is effectively firing Mr. Robinson, and
in Mr. Nicholson’s opinion, for no good reason.

Mr. Nicholson remarked what happened today is, in his view, one of several
highly questionable activities recently emanating from the Wayne County
Executive Office, including the recent attempts to replace Mr. Robinson as CEO
with a County Executive appointee. Mr. Nicholson stated that while unable to
save Mr. Robinson's job, the Board was able to block this plainly political
maneuvering.

James Nicholson strongly urged the Airport Authority to take the following
actions:

e Launch a thorough and fully transparent search for a new Airport
Authority CEO.

e Task members of the next State legislature with amending Michigan’s
Public Act 90, covering the Airport Authority, to change the formula for
appointing of Board members to ensure a balance between gubernatorial
and County appointments on the Board at any one time.

e Protect the financial assets of the Airport from attempts to use them for
the relief of County budget shortfalls.

e |Insist that Board members act in the best interest of the entire Southeast
Michigan region, favoring no area over another.

e Ensure that the Airport Authority Board act as an independent entity that it
is by law, not as a vehicle for undue persuasion, power, jobs or worse.

e Continue the excellence that has been the hallmark of the Airport
Authority for the last 8 years.

Mr. Nicholson stated that he strongly objects to what is being done and will
reluctantly vote for this motion because even one more day of Lester Robinson is

better than none.

Motion by Bernard Parker; Supported by Reneé Axt
Motion unanimously approved.
[Approved Resolution No. 10 - 43]
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VL.

Interim Chief Executive Officer Appointment

Bernard Parker motioned to appoint Genelle Allen, Executive Vice President, as
the Interim Chief Executive Officer effective July 1, 2010.

Motion by Bernard Parker; Supported by James Settles
Motion unanimously approved.
[Approved Resolution No. 10 - 44]

Report from Chief Financial Officer

Thomas Naughton, Executive Vice President and Chief Financial Officer,
reviewed the Airport Authority’s April 2010 Passenger Traffic Report and the
March 2010 Management Report.

Mr. Naughton reported that the recommended Fiscal Year 2011 (FY 2011)
Budget will be distributed to the airlines and to the Board by July 30, 2010.
Thomas Naughton asked the Board if they would like a budget study session
scheduled in June or July, giving them an opportunity for their input in formulating
the FY 2011 Budget.

Samuel Nouhan commented that he thought the June FY 2010 Budget Study
Session was a success, and in response to the Board's input, the approved
budget had a considerably less projected cost per enplanement, approximately
$1.00. Mr. Nouhan found the meeting very valuable and supports a budget study
session in June or July this year. Mr. Nouhan stated that there is a much better
opportunity for meaningful discussion between the Board and the administration
in regard to high level priorities on the budget when there is a meeting mid-
summer. Samuel Nouhan recommended that the budget study session focus on
proposed revenue, proposed expenditures, estimations of enplanements and
projected cost per enplanement. Bernard Parker and Reneé Axt commented
they too would like a budget study session in June or July. Ms. Axt requested
that staff look at organizationally how operations are ranked, and see in what
areas we could operate more leanly. Charlie Williams confirmed that the Board
would like a FY 2011 Budget Study Session scheduled in June or July, 2010.

Thomas Naughton responded to Mary Zuckerman's question regarding the
positive utility variance relative to the budget.

At the request of Charlie Williams at the March 25" Board meeting, Matt
McGowan, Director of Parking Services, provided a presentation on the Airport
Authority’s parking strategy, short-term, mid-term and long-term plans.

Reneé Axt thanked Matt McGowan for the report on parking and commented,
after a year of asking about it, it was the first time that she's heard something that
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Vil.

begins to chart a path and is the beginning of a good strategy. Ms. Axt urged
the Airport Authority staff to continue to work on the parking strategy internally
and, as Lester Robinson and Thomas Naughton mentioned at the last Board
meeting, include Delta Air Lines in the conversations.

Mary Zuckerman asked questions regarding the targeted traveler, the launch
date for the parking strategy's short-term plan and the revenue projection and
Matt McGowan, Thomas Naughton and Lester Robinson responded. Thomas
Naughton clarified for Bernard Parker that lowering the parking rate does not
require the Board's approval and that the Airport Authority is planning to go
ahead with the parking plan, unless there were some objections from the Board.
Bernard Parker commented that he agreed with what Ms. Axt said that the Board
has been asking about the parking plan for awhile, and he is glad that the Airport
Authority is now moving on with a plan. Thomas Naughton responded to
Bernard Parker's question regarding the budget for advertisement and clarified
that advertising is a critical component to the parking strategy, to recapture the
market and generate the revenue. Matt McGowan responded to Bernard
Parker’'s question regarding offering an additional reduction for a period of time to
draw customers.

Renee Axt noted that after the focus on parking at the last Board meeting, there
were internal changes in the team overseeing parking and that staff had done a
good job in the short period of time to get where we are now with a strategy for
increasing parking revenues. Ms. Axt further noted that the Board would be
interested to see if the strategy works or not and that hopefully in the next 30
days more would be known about the strategic direction.

New Business
A. JPMorgan Chase Bank, NA (Operating Line of Credit Renewal)

Resolution to authorize renewal of the Airport Authority's existing
Operating Line of Credit with JPMorgan Chase Bank, NA in the amount
of fifteen million dollars ($15,000,000.00).

Mary Zuckerman remarked this is the sixth renewal and asked if the
Airport Authority is going to rebid this line of credit at some point and
Thomas Naughton responded that the pricing on the line is very good and
only offered to the Authority because of the pre-existing business
relationship with Chase. Mr. Naughton further indicated that when we had
talked to other banks about the line in the past and that the terms were
nowhere near as attractive as Chase's and that in the current market it
would be very difficult to get any other bank to propose a liquidity facility
like this. Mr. Naughton indicated that if the market changes going forward,
we would put out an RFP to see what else is out there.
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Motion by James Nicholson; Supported by Reneé Axt
Motion unanimously approved.
[Approved Resolution No. 10 - 45]

Voice Over Internet Protocol (VolP) Equipment, Software and
Services (Avaya)

1.

Airport Authority Telephone Services Presentation

Arun Gulati, Vice President for Technology Services, provided a
presentation on the VoIP telephone system, which represents a
cost reduction and services improvement opportunity. Mr. Gulati
introduced Richard English, an industry expert that has done
telecommunication design and implementation for over 20 airports
around the Country. Mr. English reviewed a summary of the
comprehensive analysis that was performed for this project,
including return on investment results.

Arun Gulati and Richard English responded to Mary Zuckerman's
questions regarding the location of the servers, if the Airport
Authority has received formal commitments from the airlines, the
reliability of the VolP telephone system and the scope of the
contract award recommendation. Ms. Zuckerman recommended to
the Board to pass on this item today and ask the Airport Authority
staff to scope back on the VolP telephone system contracts with
the ability to amend it upon the airlines agreeing to this system.

Bernard Parker and Charlie Williams asked about the service
contract for the VolP telephone system and Arun Gulati responded.
Mary Lou Posa and Lester Robinson responded to Bernard
Parker's question regarding the amount requested for the
telephone system.

At the request of Charlie Williams, Mary Lou Posa, Vice President —
Associate General Counsel, clarified it is two separate contracts for
the VolIP telephone system and provided additional information.

Charlie Williams asked what the negative impact is if these
contracts are not approved at today's Board meeting and Arun
Gulati, Thomas Naughton and Mary Lou Posa responded.

SKC Communication Products, Inc. (Primary Contractor)
Altura Communication Solutions (Secondary Contractor)

Resolution to approve contracts with SKC Communication
Products, Inc., and Altura Communication Solutions, to
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procure, implement and maintain Avaya Unified Communications
Hardware and Software to replace the current Centrex (internal
routing) telephone system with VolP at Detroit Metropolitan and
Willow Run Airports. SKC Communication Products will perform as
the primary contractor; Altura Communication Solutions will perform
as the secondary contractor in the event SKC Communication
Products is unable to meet the Airport Authority's succeeding
scheduling needs; cannot provide the approved materials; or
provides lower item pricing. The term of the contracts is an initial
three (3) year term, with four (4) one-year renewal options that will
require Board approval. The total costs of the two contracts will not
exceed $1,752,225.00 (for the initial three-year term). The
contracts were competitively solicited; contracts deemed lowest
responsive bid from a responsible bidder and second lowest
responsive bid from a responsible bidder.

Lester Robinson clarified the VolP telephone system is for the
entire Airport, including the airlines. Mr. Robinson further explained
there are 2 contracts for a not to exceed price of $1,752,225.00,
one with SKC Communications Products, Inc., as a primary
contractor, and the second with Altura Communication Solutions,
as a secondary contractor.

James Nicholson moved to approve the VolP telephone system
contracts.

Bernard Parker abstained from voting on this item because Wayne
County has the VolIP telephone system.

Motion by James Nicholson; Supported by Samuel Nouhan
Ayes: Axt, Nicholson, Nouhan, Settles, Williams

Nay: Zuckerman

Abstained: Parker

Motion approved.

[Approved Resolution No. 10 - 46]

Snow and Ice Removal and Grading Services

This item is postponed.

Dan’s Excavating, Inc. (Ground Run-Up Enclosure (GRE) Facility —
Detroit Metropolitan Airport)

Resolution to approve a contract with Dan’s Excavating, Inc., to
construct a Ground Run-Up Enclosure (GRE) Facility, including all
associated systems (i.e., electrical, drainage, pavement markings) at

WCAA Board Meeting
Minutes — 5/27/10

Page 10



Detroit Metropolitan Airport. The term of the contract will commence upon
issuance of Notice to Proceed and terminate upon the Airport Authority's
final payment for all required services (Estimated substantial completion:
February 2011). The cost of the contract is not to exceed $9,085,748.00.
The contract was competitively solicited; contract deemed lowest
responsive bid from a responsible bidder. The contract costs are grant
eligible.

At the request of Bernard Parker, Genelle Allen, Executive Vice President,
reported that Dan’'s Excavating has participated on two Airport Authority
contracts, as a subcontractor, and they were deemed compliant with
regard to their Disadvantaged Business Enterprise (DBE) participation
commitments and deemed eligible to contract with the Airport Authority.
Ms. Allen further reported that the Airport Authority Legal Department did
confirm with the federal government that Dan’s Excavating has complied
with their DBE settlement agreement and is also now eligible to participate
on federal contracts again.

Motion by Samuel Nouhan; Supported by James Nicholson
Motion unanimously approved.
[Approved Resolution No. 10 - 47]

Blaze Contracting, Inc. (Deicing Fluid Force Main Sewer System,
Phase Il Portion)

Resolution to approve a contract with Blaze Contracting, Inc., to
construct the Phase |l portion of the deicing fluid force main sewer system,
including approximately five (5) miles of piping outside of the Detroit
Metropolitan Airport property, and installation of a control system for a
pump station previously constructed under Phase I. The term of the
contract will commence upon issuance of Notice to Proceed and terminate
upon the Airport Authority’'s final payment for all required services
(Estimated completion: Spring 2012). The cost of the contract is not to
exceed $4,323,352.00. The contract was competitively solicited; contract
deemed lowest responsive bid from a responsible bidder. The contract
costs are grant eligible.

For the record, Charlie Williams reported that Blaze Contracting is a
subcontractor on a contract that his company is involved in, not with the
Airport but with the City of Detroit.

Bernard Parker asked if there is any DBE participation and Genelle Allen
responded the prime contractor, Blaze Contracting, Inc., is a DBE.
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Motion by Mary Zuckerman; Supported by Reneé Axt
Abstained: Charlie Williams

Motion unanimously approved.

[Approved Resolution No. 10 - 48]

Audit Committee Report — April 28, 2010 Audit Committee Meeting

Samuel Nouhan, Audit Committee Chairperson, provided a summary of the
Special Audit Committee meeting on April 28, 2010. Mr. Nouhan reported that
the Audit Committee learned at the March Audit Committee meeting that the
parking management contractor was not making its records available for auditing
purposes, and that in the past there was an insufficient response from Airport
administration to force the contractor to make its records available for auditing
purposes under the terms of the contract. Samuel Nouhan further reported that
Airport administration had amended a parking related contract, without Board
approval for quite a substantial amount, and had concealed such amendments
by improperly passing the costs of the amendments through the parking
management contractor. Therefore, at the March meeting, Mr. Nouhan called a
Special Audit Committee meeting on April 28 to further explore the issues
involving parking related contracts. At the April 28" meeting the Audit Committee
expressed its very forceful support and encouragement for forcing the parking
management contractor to make its records available for audit and instructed the
Internal Auditor to expand the audit to encompass a greater time frame. The
parking management contractor did make its records available and with further
work by the Internal Auditor revealed a slew of no bid contracts that were paid
through the parking management contract. Those no bid contracts, awarded
back to 2005, involved purchases of various goods and services and the
purchases of capital goods which are not authorized under the parking
management contract. The no bid contracts included at least one purchase for
equipment that was incompatible with Airport facilities and had to be returned at
a $450,000.00 loss to the Airport Authority. Mr. Nouhan reported that the Internal
Auditor is continuing his work to root out these improper no bid contracts with the
full support of the Audit Committee.

Samuel Nouhan stated that his goal and commitment as Chairman of the Audit
Committee is to eliminate the contract mismanagement that has plagued these
parking contracts and parking operations.

The next Audit Committee meeting is scheduled for June 16, at which time the
Internal Auditor’s report will be completed.

Report from Chief Executive Officer

A. CEO Monthly Report — pursuant to WCAA Procurement and
Contracting Ordinance, Section 7.J
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Mr. Robinson reported the March and April 2010 monthly reports on
contracts issued under the authority of the Chief Executive Officer are
included in the Board's meeting materials.

B. Small Business Enterprise (SBE) Participation - FY 2010 Monthly
Report

Lester Robinson informed the Board that the Small Business Enterprise
(SBE) Participation Report is now included in the Board’s meeting
materials under the Chief Executive Officer Report, as requested by
Bernard Parker.

Lester Robinson stated that since this is effectively the last board meeting for him
that he wanted to be very brief on the comments that were just made by the Audit
Committee and that he did not agree with the statements but that he did not want
to go in to the details of that now.

Mr. Robinson further remarked that he appreciated the opportunity the Board has
given him to lead the Airport Authority over the past 10 years. He indicated that
he thinks that we have come through a number of very difficult situations, and
that we've brought the Airport Authority, from what at one point was called the
worst airport in terms of customer satisfaction, to the best and as a result of that,
he has, in his opinion, accomplished all the Airport Authority's goals and all of his
goals, and he is ready to pass the torch on to Genelle Allen, who has been
appointed by the Board.

Chairman’s Comments

Charlie Williams commented that he has been on the Airport Authority Board for
3 years and thinks Lester Robinson is a good administrator, he has learned a lot
from Lester and thinks that Lester has done a good job.

Mr. Williams also acknowledged Genelle Allen, who is going to be the Airport
Authority's Interim Chief Executive Officer, and mentioned she has many
credentials, including working at Cleveland'’s airport.

Charlie Williams stated that he disagrees with James Nicholson’s earlier remarks
at today's meeting. Mr. Williams clarified that when Wayne County Executive
Ficano appointed him to the Airport Authority Board he was told by Mr. Ficano to
work hard to reduce the costs and raise revenue and pass it on to the airlines,
don’t get comfortable as a Board member, think outside of the box and make
sure there's minority participation at the Airport. Charlie Williams commented
that's what he was charged with and that's what he plans to do, and that there
has been no chicanery or hanky-panky and resents the implication that there is
or might be.
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James Nicholson stated that he stands by his comment.

Bernard Parker stated that he shares in the Chairperson’'s and James
Nicholson's remarks that Lester Robinson has done an outstanding job at the
Airport. Mr. Parker further commented that he also had the honor of working with
Mr. Robinson at Wayne County and knows what type of individual and leader he
is and has done an outstanding job in moving the Airport forward. Mr. Parker
further remarked that we should all recognize there is not any position in public
office where you stay forever. Bernard Parker commended Lester Robinson for
all he has done and knows he is going to be successful in whatever capacity he
decides to do. Bernard Parker remarked that he differs with the idea that the
Board is in some type of cahoots or doing something to run Lester Robinson out
of the position. Mr. Parker stated that in the public sector we have the
responsibility to always be willing to look for something in addition to what we
have right now and never get satisfied with where we're at. Mr. Parker stated
that he was not aware of any plan that was put into place and counters the
comments given by one of the Board members at the beginning of the meeting,
and assures the Airport Authority will continue to move forward.

James Settles remarked that Lester Robinson has really done a yeoman's job.
Mr. Settles thanked Lester Robinson for everything he has done for the Airport
and wishes him well. Mr. Settles further commented that he is really sad to see
Mr. Robinson leave but he is also very proud of him and knows the Airport
Authority is in very good hands with the excellent person replacing him, and who
he has taught, Genelle Allen. James Settles also stated that he too was
appointed by Wayne County Executive Ficano and Mr. Ficano never approached
him about any decision, that he was told by Mr. Ficano when he first got the job
to be an independent thinker and do what he thought was the right thing to do.
Mr. Settles thanked the Airport Authority Board and remarked that he appreciates
working with them, including Mr. Nicholson, and that he respects Mr. Nicholson's
statement earlier in today’s meeting because obviously that's what he feels.
James Settles remarked that, collectively, both the current Airport Authority
Board members, and the former members of the Board, work extremely well
together. Even though the Board members may disagree on an issue, all of
them believe in the same goal in having the best airport that we can possibly
have and Mr. Robinson has given that leadership and he knows that will
continue.

Mary Zuckerman remarked that she is in a little bit of a unique role as an Airport
Authority Board member — she’'s known Lester Robinson for 15 years, worked for
him at one point, and she was also there as one of the crafters of the Airport
Authority and actually has lots of wounds yet today through getting this structure
through the legislative process at that time. It was very clear at that time, the
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XI.

Xil.

XIlL.

sentiment as to the direction and purpose of the Airport Authority, and she
wanted to thank Lester and the team that he has out here in terms of recognizing
this as a major multi-billion dollar business with millions of customers and an
important economic engine to the region. Ms. Zuckerman thanked Lester
Robinson for his service and welcomed Genelle Allen as the Airport Authority’s
interim leader. Mary Zuckerman stressed to all members of the management
team and to her fellow Board members that the Airport Authority has a big
responsibility that we need to handle appropriately during this transition because
what we do as a Board, and what we do every day as management members of
this team affects the region and lots of customers, so it is important that we
recognize again the reason the Airport Authority was created, the sentiment
under which it was created and the purpose for which it was created and stay
true to what that was all about. Ms. Zuckerman thanked Lester Robinson and
remarked that she appreciates all the hard work he has put into this.

Public Comment

Charlie Williams opened the floor for Public Comment at 3:05 p.m. No public
comment was received. Public Comment closed at 3:05 p.m.

Closed Session

Lester Robinson reported a Closed Session is necessary to discuss legal issues
with the Airport Authority’'s General Counsel.

Motion by Bernard Parker; Supported by Mary Zuckerman
Motion unanimously approved.

Roll Call was taken for Closed Session at 3:06 p.m.
Board meeting recalled to order at 3:50 p.m. and Roll Call was taken.
United States of America v. Wayne County Airport Authority

Resolution that the Wayne County Airport Authority Board approves the motion
for an amended judgment in said matter, pursuant to which the original probation
under the Rule 11 Plea Agreement is revoked and the Airport Authority accepts a
new three-year term of probation during which time the Airport Authority will be
required to complete the Force Main project, pursuant to the original terms
described in the Rule 11 Plea Agreement.

Motion by James Nicholson; Supported by Mary Zuckerman
Motion unanimously approved.
[Approved Resolution No. 10 - 49]

WCAA Board Meeting
Minutes — 5/27/10
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XIV. Next meeting of the Wayne County Airport Authority Board is July 29, 2010.
Location to be confirmed.

XV. Adjourn
Meeting adjourned at 4:00 p.m.

Motion by Mary Zuckerman; Supported by Bernard Parker
Motion unanimously approved.

WCAA Board Meeting
Minutes — 5/27/10
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